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A page-turning, wicked romp of bitchy one-upmanship and competition wrapped in a hilarious,
satirical bow.

Dynamic PR guru Gemma Bristol has her well-manicured finger firmly on the pulse of the Australian social
scene. She regularly rubs shoulders with the country's A-listers at the glittering opening nights and exclusive
launches she hosts.

But away from the shining lights of her stellar career, life is much less glamorous. Her husband has become a
stranger, her teenage son is angry and uncommunicative, and somehow the career she has worked so hard for
doesn't seem to satisfy her anymore.

Gemma needs a new direction, but has she gone too far when she challenges the grand matriarch of
Melbourne philanthropy, Dame Frances Davenport, to a fundraising duel that captivates the city? And is it
just her imagination or is her handsome New York colleague flirting with her? Not that she'd act on it
anyway; she's a married woman, right?

As the charity duel heats up and the social pages buzz with excitement, Gemma faces some big questions
about her future and her family that will change her life forever.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Wilkerson:

With other case, little folks like to read book Armani Angels. You can choose the best book if you appreciate
reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book Armani Angels. You can add knowledge
and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can
understand everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About
simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe
searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored to go to the library.
Let's examine.

Ida Shrout:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind
of reserve you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want sense
happy read one together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The Armani Angels is kind
of book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

David Waymire:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book entitled
Armani Angels your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that
maybe not known for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a guide then
become one form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get prior to. The Armani Angels
giving you one more experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful details for your
better life on this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind is going to
be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Susan Douglas:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This publication Armani Angels was filled concerning science. Spend your time to add
your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a new
book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era
like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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